
TOURNAMENT DESCRIPTIONS 
 

 Eclectic Tournament 
 The Eclectic Tournament is an 18-hole individual event played 

over 2 consecutive rounds. The better score (from the 2 
rounds) for each hole is your Eclectic 18-hole score. Winners 
include the overall low gross and net champions, as well as 
gross and net places in each flight. You do not need to play in 
both rounds to compete in this tournament. If we do not fill the 
entire tee sheet with Tournament players, we will have room 
for EOF (End of Field) players on 1 or both play dates.  

 
 President’s Cup Tournament 

 The President’s Cup is a 36 hole, individual, stroke play 
tournament. Each player must complete all 18 holes on both 
days by recording gross scores for each hole. This is a NET 
Tournament. Only your Net 36-hole score will count for the 
competition. An overall Net champion will be crowned, along 
with places in each flight. You may choose to play from either 
the Green or Gold tees. If we do not fill the entire tee sheet with 
Tournament players, we will have room for EOF (End of Field) 
players on 1 or both play dates. 

 
 

 Partner’s Tournament 
 The Partner’s Tournament is a 36 hole two-person team stroke 

play tournament using Stableford Scoring. Each two-person 
team must be made up of PWGA members with USGA 
handicap indexes within 10 strokes of each other. Teams must 
play both days (36 holes) to be eligible for prizes. The format on 
day 1 is Net Better-Ball of the two team members. The format 
on day 2 is Net Combined score of the two team members. All 
play is from the Gold tees. Overall payouts will be to the low 
gross team, and the low net team. There will also be Flight 
payouts for net scores only. If we do not fill the entire tee sheet 



with Tournament players, we will have room for EOF (End of 
Field) players on 1 or both play dates.  

 

 

 Club Championship 
 The Club Championship is a 36 Hole Stroke Play Competition 

to determine the annual PWGA Club Champion (Gross 
competition). There will also be Flight gross and net prizes. 
Each player must complete all 18 holes on both days by 
recording gross scores on the official scorecard. Any member 
in good standing with the PWGA is eligible to compete - 
however, you must have played a certain number of times 
(TBD each year) with the PWGA league to be eligible to 
compete in the Club Championship. To be eligible to win the 
Club Championship, you must play from the Green tees 
(Championship Flight). All other flights play from the Gold tees. 
If we do not fill the entire tee sheet with Tournament players, 
we will have room for EOF (End of Field) players on 1 or both 
play dates.  

 

 

 AZGolf Women’s State Medallion Tournament  

 

 AZGolf hosts a statewide Women's tournament called the 
State Medallion, typically held in January each year. 
Participating clubs can send 1 team of 2 to compete in the 
event. Each season the PWGA holds 4 State Medallion 
Qualifier play days to determine the winning team of 2. Each 
participant best 2 qualifying scores count. The Low Gross 
winner (playing from the Green tees) and the Low Net winner 
(playing from Green or Gold) will represent the PWGA at the 
following years AZGolf Women’s State Medallion Tournament. 


